RFP 2022-120 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SELF-INSURED WORKERS' COMPENSATION PROGRAM CLAIMS
ADMINISTRATION, COST CONTAINMENT, 504 PROGRAM ADMINISTRATION, AND/OR MEDICAL CASE

MANAGEMENT

BUNDLED PRICING SCORES

SECONDARY PRIMARY
AWARD AWARD
Sedgwick
TRISTAR Claims Claims AS&G Claims Cannon Cochran
MAX Management Management Administration, Management
EVALUATION CRITERIA POINTS Services S ) g I Inc. Services, Inc.
Corpus Christi, TX erwce_s, nc. Houston, TX Danville, IL
HUB - No Memphis, TN | B _No HUB - No
HUB - No
GENERAL INFORMATION 200 129.58 134.12 126.00 126.77
SECTION 1 - CLAIMS
ADMINISTRATION 100 40.35 41.04 36.98 40.47
SECTION 2 - COST CONTAINMENT 100 37.21 43.56 38.58 40.08
SECTION 3 - 504 PROGRAM 100 36.94 42.81 38.34 32.18
SECTION 4 - MEDICAL CASE
MANAGEMENT 100 39.68 43.31 40.82 40.14
REFERENCES 100 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
PRICE FOR ALL SECTIONS 300 291.47 300.00 * *
TOTAL 1000 635.24 664.84 340.72 339.63

*Vendor did not offer bundled pricing.
No Bid: Texas Association of Counties




RFP 2022-120 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SELF-INSURED WORKERS' COMPENSATION PROGRAM CLAIMS

ADMINISTRATION, COST CONTAINMENT, 504 PROGRAM ADMINISTRATION, AND/OR MEDICAL CASE MANAGEMENT

INITIAL SCORES - A LA CARTE PRICING

TRISTAR Claims Sedgwmk AS&G Claims | Cannon Cochran Medicus RX . .
Claims . . Davies Claims
MAX Management Manaaement Administration, Management Pharmacy, Inc. Solutions. LLC
EVALUATION CRITERIA Services ) 9 Inc. Services, Inc. dba MedicusRx o
POINTS . Services, Inc. . Nashville, TN
Corpus Christi, TX Memphis. TN Houston, TX Danville, IL Houston, TX HUB - No
HUB - No phIs, HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes
HUB - No
GENERAL INFORMATION 200 129.58 134.12 126.00 126.77 118.91 117.28
SECTION 1 - CLAIMS
ADMINISTRATION 100 40.35 41.04 36.98 40.47 33.24 37.14
SECTION 2 - COST CONTAINMENT 100 37.21 43.56 38.58 40.08 32.68 37.18
SECTION 3 - 504 PROGRAM 100 36.94 42.81 38.34 32.18 NO BID NO BID
SECTION 4 - MEDICAL CASE
MANAGEMENT 100 39.68 43.31 40.82 40.14 26.04 37.10
REFERENCES 100 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 0.00 50.00
PRICE FOR ALL SECTIONS 300 295.01 291.83 295.38 300.00 * *
TOTAL 1000 638.78 656.67 636.10 639.63 210.87 278.70

*Price score not calculated because vendor did not bid on all sections.

No Bid: Texas Association of Counties
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