
Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Secondary
$11.95

Primary
$11.27

Per Case $287.00 $112.70

Packed 24 per Case 10 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1697W T6-E-60CF-12M-

NOHDL
Vendor Part 

Number 1697W T6-E-60CF-12M-
NOHDL

Dimensions 36" x 90" 36" x 94"

Thickness 6 mil 12 mil

2,4001

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

2,4001

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$9.96* $19.06

$99.60 $228.73

10 per Case 12 per Case

ADI Medical LDI

40369 EMD2-4096A

4992764 766954

36" x 90" 40" x 96"

.18 mm (7.0866 mil) 8 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

2,4001

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$18.00 $10.74*

$360.00 $214.80

20 per Case 20 per Case

Mopec Salam International, 
Inc.

BE165-WHT 11-224W

BE165-WHT 11-224W

40" x 90" 36" x 94"

7 mil 16-19 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

2,4001

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

$8.00*

$80.00

10 per Case

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

SC-030

SC-030

36" x 90"

7 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Primary
$38.00 $50.79*

Per Case $456.00 $203.16

Packed 12 per Case 4 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1640B T8-E-60CF-12M-CFX08-

US
Vendor Part 

Number 1640B T8-E-60CF-12M-CFX08-
US

Dimensions 72" x 90" 54" x 108"

Thickness 6 mil 12 mil

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Bariatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 72"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

2 250

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Bariatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 72"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

2 250

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Bariatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 72"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

2 250

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$65.00* No Bid

$325.00 No Bid

5 per Case No Bid

Mopec No Bid

BE177 No Bid

BE177 No Bid

54" x 98" No Bid

7 mil No Bid

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Bariatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 72"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

2 250

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Secondary
$19.91

Primary
$16.79

Per Case $239.00 $167.90

Packed 12 per Case 10 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1630B T6-E-60CF-12M-CFX06-US

Vendor Part 
Number 1630B T6-E-60CF-12M-CFX06-US

Dimensions 36" x 90" 36" x 94"

Thickness 6 mil 12 mil

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Transport
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

3 1,800

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Transport
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

3 1,800

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$24.77 Withdrew bid for item

$123.85 Withdrew bid for item

5 per Case Withdrew bid for item

ADI Medical Withdrew bid for item

40495 Withdrew bid for item

4992428 Withdrew bid for item

36" x 90" Withdrew bid for item

.5 mm (19.685 mil) Withdrew bid for item

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Transport
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

3 1,800

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$17.00* $18.44*

$255.00 $276.60

15 per Case 15 per Case

Mopec Salam International, 
Inc.

BE179 11-234

BE179 11-234

31.5" x 86.5" 36" x 94"

8 mil 16-19 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Transport
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

3 1,800

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

$23.00

$230.00

10 per Case

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

SC-041

SC-041

36" x 90"

10 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Primary
$40.16

Secondary
$42.29

Per Case $241.00 $422.90

Packed 6 per Case 10 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1632B B6-E-97CF-24M-

CFX06-US
Vendor Part 

Number 1632B B6-E-97CF-24M-
CFX06-US

Dimensions 36" x 90" 36" x 94"

Thickness 12 mil 24 mil

4

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Disaster Bags
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 12 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

150

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

4

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Disaster Bags
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 12 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

150

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$24.77* $77.17

$123.85 $463.02

5 per Case 6 per Case

ADI Medical LDI

40495 ETH2-3894

4992428 486938

36" x 90" 38" x 94"

.5 mm (19.685 mil) 20 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

4

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Disaster Bags
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 12 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

150

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$46.00 $18.44*

$322.00 $276.60

7 per Case 15 per Case

Mopec Salam International, 
Inc.

BE411-504-EZ 11-234

BE411-504-EZ 11-234

36" x 94" 36" x 94"

12 mil 16-19 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

4

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Disaster Bags
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 36"
Length: Minimum 90"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper Handles: Minimum 6
Thickness: Minimum 12 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

150

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Secondary
$8.10

Primary
$3.40

Per Case $81.00 $68.00

Packed 10 per Case 20 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1616W T1-E-50CF-10M-

NOHDL-MX
Vendor Part 

Number 1616W T1-E-50CF-10M-
NOHDL-MX

Dimensions 18" x 30" 22" x 30"

Thickness 6 mil 10 mil

5

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 18"
Length: Minimum 30"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

5

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 18"
Length: Minimum 30"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$3.13* $10.71

$62.60 $128.49

20 per Case 12 per Case

ADI Medical LDI

40469 EMD2-2448A

None 979262

18' x 27" 24" x 48"

.18 mm (7.0866 mil) 8 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

5

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 18"
Length: Minimum 30"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$10.00* $7.75*

$200.00 $155.00

20 per Case 20 per Case

Mopec Salam International, 
Inc.

BE411-228W-LZ 11-226

BE411-228W-LZ 11-226

12" x 24" 24" x 48"

7 mil 16-19 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

5

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 18"
Length: Minimum 30"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

$3.00*

$150.00

50 per Case

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

SC-1932IF

SC-1932IF

22" x 30"

7 mil

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

E.M. Adams Company
Fort Pierce, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Extra Packaging LLC
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Price Price

Per Bag Primary
$8.40

Secondary
$9.35

Per Case $84.00 $187.00

Packed 10 per Case 20 per Case

Manufacturer E.M. Adams Company Extra Packaging LLC

Manufacturer 
Part Number 1615W T3-E-50CF-12M-

NOHOL-MX
Vendor Part 

Number 1615W T3-E-50CF-12M-
NOHOL-MX

Dimensions 33" x 40" 36" x 60"

Thickness 6 mil 12 mil

Discount for Items not listed above No Bid By Levels
Minimum order requirements None Case Quantity

6

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Pediatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 28"
Length: Minimum 40"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Discount for Items not listed above
Minimum order requirements

6

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Pediatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 28"
Length: Minimum 40"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical Government 

Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$4.64* No Bid

$46.40 No Bid

10 per Case No Bid

ADI Medical No Bid

40479 No Bid

4993396 No Bid

28" x 48" No Bid

.18 mm (7.0866 mil) No Bid

34% No Bid
Case Quantity None

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Discount for Items not listed above
Minimum order requirements

6

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Pediatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 28"
Length: Minimum 40"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

MP Acquisition LLC 
d/b/a Mopec

Madison Heights, MI
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Salam International, 
Inc.

Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price Price

$12.00* $7.75*

$240.00 $155.00

20 per Case 20 per Case

Mopec Salam International, 
Inc.

BE411-226W-EZ 11-226

BE411-226W-EZ 11-226

24" x 48" 24" x 48"

7 mil 16-19 mil

5% No Bid
$500.00 None

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Item Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Per Bag

Per Case

Packed

Manufacturer

Manufacturer 
Part Number
Vendor Part 

Number

Dimensions

Thickness

Discount for Items not listed above
Minimum order requirements

6

Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Pediatric
Color: Any
Width: Minimum 28"
Length: Minimum 40"
Zipper: “U” zipper, large double zipper 
Handles: None required
Thickness: Minimum 6 mil, heavy-duty scrim reinforcement 
laminated between two layers of virgin high-strength 
polyethylene film. Must be chlorine and latex free 
Polyethylene so that it does not release chlorine gases. 
Bags must have sealed edges. Bags must be approved for 
cremation. Bags must meet OSHA Regulation 3130, 
Occupational Exposure to Bloodborne Pathogens - 
Precautions for Emergency Responders.

200

Smart Choice 
Industries, Inc. d/b/a 

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

Price

$6.65*

$133.00

20 per Case

Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

SC-CP28

SC-CP28

32" x 48"

8 mil

No Bid
None

Quadmed, Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed addendum. 

*Does not meet specifications.  See separate spreadsheet for reason.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Justification for Non-Awards

Item Product Description Vendor Reason

1 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult Henry Schein, Inc. Bag ripped at seam upon sample testing.

1 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult Salam International, Inc. Bag leaked upon sample testing.

1 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Adult
Smart Choice Industries, Inc. 
d/b/a Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Bag tore at cold temperature upon sample 
testing.

2 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Bariatric Extra Packaging LLC Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

2 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Bariatric MP Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mopec Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

3 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Transport MP Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mopec Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

3 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Transport Salam International, Inc. Bag leaked upon sample testing.

4 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Disaster Bags Henry Schein, Inc. Zipper broke upon sample testing.

4 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Disaster Bags Salam International, Inc. Bag leaked upon sample testing.

5 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant Henry Schein, Inc. Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

5 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant MP Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mopec Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

5 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant Salam International, Inc. Bag is not infant sized.  

5 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, Infant
Smart Choice Industries, Inc. 
d/b/a Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Bag had a straight zipper and specifications 
were for a double "U" zipper.

6 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Pediatric Henry Schein, Inc. Bag had a straight zipper and specifications 

were for a double "U" zipper.

6 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Pediatric MP Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mopec Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.



Bid 2022-093
Annual Contract for Body Bags

Justification for Non-Awards

6 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Pediatric Salam International, Inc. Bag does not meet minimum size requirement.

6 Reinforced Leakproof Body Bag, 
Pediatric

Smart Choice Industries, Inc. 
d/b/a Smart Choice Funeral 
Supplies

Bag tore at cold temperature upon sample 
testing.
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