
Award

Maximum 
Point 
Value

CDW Government 
LLC

Vernon Hills, IL
HUB - No

200 164.00

150 123.00

150 105.00

150 120.00

100 28.00

250 250.00

1000 790.00

Note:  Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. withdrew their proposal after the Best and Final Offer because they discovered that they 
could not honor the required four (4) year term at the same or better pricing than the pricing offered in their initial RFP response. 

RFP 2021-062, Annual Contract for Tech Refresh Program
Best and Final Offer Evaluation Scores

Total

References

Price

Vendor Capability and 
Experience

Respondent 
Experience

Qualifications of Staff

Proposed Hardware



Maximum 
Point 
Value

CDW Government 
LLC

Vernon Hills, IL
HUB - No

Netsync Network 
Solutions, Inc.
Carrollton, TX

HUB - Yes

200 164.00 156.00

150 123.00 117.00

150 105.00 126.00

150 120.00 126.00

100 28.00 50.67

250 211.84 250.00

1000 751.84 825.67

Price

Total

Respondent 
Experience

Qualifications of Staff

Proposed Hardware

References

RFP 2021-062, Annual Contract for Tech Refresh Program

Presentation and Demonstration Evaluation Scores

Vendor Capability and 
Experience



Maximum 
Point 
Value

CDW Government 
LLC

Vernon Hills, IL
HUB - No

Dahill Office 
Technology 

Corporation dba Xerox 
Business Solutions 

Southwest
Coppell, TX
HUB - No

GTS Technology 
Solutions, Inc.

Austin, TX
HUB - Yes

Happy Computer, Inc. 
dba ITRemedy

Plano, TX
HUB - Yes

200 164.00 108.00 124.00 116.00

150 126.00 94.50 106.50 93.00

150 111.00 84.00 84.00 93.00

150 114.00 102.00 108.00 120.00

100 28.00 36.00 26.67 44.00

250 211.84 148.02 206.18 106.16

1000 754.84 572.52 655.35 572.16

CCKYM was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum 1.
Scantron Corporation submitted a no-bid.
System MD submitted a no-bid.

RFP 2021-062, Annual Contract for Tech Refresh Program

Proposed Hardware

References

Price

Total

Initial Evaluation Scores

Vendor Capability and 
Experience

Respondent 
Experience

Qualifications of Staff



Maximum 
Point 
Value

Netsync Network 
Solutions, Inc.
Carrollton, TX

HUB - Yes

Premier LogiTech, LLC
Coppell, TX
HUB - Yes

SHI Government 
Solutions, Inc.

Austin, TX
HUB - Yes

200 152.00 124.00 148.00

150 112.50 96.00 106.50

150 120.00 72.00 111.00

150 126.00 102.00 120.00

100 50.67 60.00 0.00

250 250.00 188.48 137.86

1000 811.17 642.48 623.36

CCKYM was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum 1.
Scantron Corporation submitted a no-bid.
System MD submitted a no-bid.

Initial Evaluation Scores

RFP 2021-062, Annual Contract for Tech Refresh Program

Proposed Hardware

References

Price

Total

Vendor Capability and 
Experience

Respondent 
Experience

Qualifications of Staff
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